REGULAR MEETING - 7:00 PM

1.
2.

3.

10.

GRANDVIEW CITY COUNCIL
REGULAR MEETING AGENDA
TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 8, 2016

CALL TO ORDER & ROLL CALL

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

PRESENTATIONS

A. Grandview School District — Prebond Planning 1-2
PUBLIC COMMENT - The public may address the Council on items on the agenda.

CONSENT AGENDA - Items on the Consent Agenda will be voted on together by the Council,
unless a Councilmember reguests that items be removed from the Consent Agenda and discussed
and voted upon separately. An item removed from the Consent Agenda will be placed under
Unfinished and New Business.

Minutes of the October 24, 2016 Special Council meeting — Budget 3-6
Minutes of the October 25, 2016 Committee-of-the-Whole meeting 7-9
Minutes of the October 25, 2016 Council meeting 10-13

Payroll Electronic Fund Transfers (EFT) Nos. 5652-5657 in the amount of $85,832.45

Payroll Check Nos. 9200-9238 in the amount of $27,438.04

Payroll Direct Deposit 10/16/16-10/31/16 in the amount of $97,545.63

Claim Check Nos. 111609-111699 in the amount of $132,371.60

Resolution No. 2016-47 declaring certain City property from the Fire Department as 14-15
surplus and authorizing disposal by public auction, sale or trade

IOMMOOW>

ACTIVE AGENDA - Notice: ltems discussed at the 6:00 pm Committee-of-the-Whole meeting of an
urgent or time sensitive nature may be added to the active agenda pursuant to City Council Procedures
Manual Section 3.18(c}).

A. Ordinance No. 2016-23 amending Grandview Municipal Code Chapter 15.24 Fire 16-23
Prevention to adopt the 2015 Edition of the International Fire Code

B. Ordinance No. 2015-24 levying the 2017 Ad Valor Property Taxes and Excess Levy 24-26
Taxes

C. Ordinance No. 2015-25 increasing the 2017 Property Tax Levy for the City of Grandview 27-28
above the “Limit Factor”, up to 101 percent

UNFINISHED AND NEW BUSINESS
CITY ADMINISTRATOR AND/OR STAFF REPORTS
MAYOR & COUNCILMEMBER MEETING REPORTS

ADJOURNMENT



spoepyaly A

ouoq e einaud

oedyiue]d

ONINNV1d
aNO4d34d

LO141S13 JOOHDS
MIIAANVYVAO

asep 3 SAN0|es § eied Ly uoisuedx]
uoisuedxa woolsse) g anyny

onYIP3 [P [enpeh vgnewiwgp

2S00 A BRI BUN RIENIAY UOPINAISUG) BADDY
buiseyd buipjing

aMSUadxa pue paediduIo pioAe 1M UNINASU0) MIN

sapepaR A [emieu uopeuusng eied Jousus one
samanoe pue bunybydep ioy piediinoy souayuy

|rueread uoDeiNIN) ap elofapy
uone[Ip uewysapad paaosdw|

wapdaind A pepunhas ap eucloy
sjuawaleyua Aiundag pue Kjajes

exjahioua enuaRYD B ap eolaw
Auaiya Abaug parosd

¥y uod opsame ap elajduiod peppqisanay
anueydurod Ayjiqissane yay [in4

WO e
Ny G TR I

GVO3 15363TIH

o{fiS ap souej.

ue|d 211§

UPIMITRIG BN P05 e

A 1068 3p sodwied & sway 3p seypiied joginy op opeis)
ulewwa) 0} SpJaY
}1eqaseq pue ||eqyos ‘'s1uned Siuua) ‘winjpels jeqioe) Bunsig

OPEJIIR1 UISIR Joiny ap odurey
PR1RY0131 PIRY 132308 Bupsing

OISEULLI} Ja] 23491 U3 IWEUR1UA/RISY UODEINP3 3 odwey
wAb o) fywixerd 3sop ul pRY 2NdEI4/Y

uefo3a1 ; uafap saaped soj anb exed opyips (e epenu ) 3 i)
Buipjing 01 duexua 1 ave) dn yid 7 yo dosp Juaiey

aLopn:

/ aiseatnh & oGy 3p 0IPEISH 18 SAISADL SOIHLIPUODT]S]
DU

wnuoxpne / wAb pue wnipels jjeqrooj 1e sjjels Bunyed ajgissany

seiay 3p sandsap sojuDAD eled HUIBNLEUODEISA 0 5asNqoyNe
61 etedl oysodoid 3)qop ap sasnqoine ap ol LU
Gunyted Juar3 sinoy-1a1)e 10 sasnq 5| 10) Gupjred snq ased:nd jeng

SefinnAA oy 21nd oYuRIIPHOLIRYS)

mau._..mm_amv .
150{190) SOJUDHISMEIO RIS T
STTvisose TN



=~

{5 = UIIIL5UL 3 S31R)0) SOH0IIS)
{5 = suoneys buneay ejop
SUUN; 3 Upjeg
Wwooy duipsapy «
EHSY UDEHDUUD 3 Ug|ae,
Wooy ssauyl -
SuiseUwil so(|
swiko omy -
i = Sajzdnuid sasip ap uojes

“—— 8 = swoosssep) Arewng «
Pt O12P0AI»

v A Y UGDINIYSHI 3P S3U01IRIS]
- _wﬁo._.a.. 343 . . e suogeys buiyeay
2 59y 261 = 0B PP Jero) Loy
GNIISIP {31 SOIBLIKE D 01IAIZS 3P BUIND) 00¢ = eixne oiseuwl ja esed sepeib sey ap pepnede) 15 59%'761 = eary buippng (e10)
UALYINY 32ALIS POO4 IPIA IHISIG 00€ = wo A1eyxny 1oy Aypede) buiyeas 1aydealg 5075 = anu of P eaty
£9- 009 = E)RIRIE) / 0]NGHSaA jap peppede) 703'L = Jedund orseuwi |2 ered sepeif sep ap peppede) - J5597'65 = ealy _Ja._ puz
9¢£9 - 009 = Aiede) buneas ajqe} e1a1a}e)/SuoNLIO) 708'L = WwAg uiey so} finede) Huneas 1ayieajg 2002 "s£1 = fednutsd [pat jp easy
JS007'€El = eaty jara] ureyy -
075 = vpoypne 3 eed pepiiede) SSWBIPNIS GUT'L = OUBSIP 3P je10] peprede;) sus|d sop ap o]
026 = wnuoypny Joj Aydede) Guiyeag sjupnis 8oz’ = Anede) ubisaq jejo) Buipjing A1015-om)
2n; ugysuedey

..... P Tty M
;
o £ st . A
\ ....!....L_.. 2
i
] A
[ L
f
f by
L A
L
o|nqinsap :
susuiurg)
; = Tl o
hae T ! by-oy :
: e w |
osidopunBag ~  S-mo-- Loy jedpulig ostd ’
|
100}4 puU0d3s L | 100]4 urepy 3 i



GRANDVIEW CITY COUNCIL
SPECIAL MEETING MINUTES — BUDGET
OCTOBER 24, 2016

1. CALL TO ORDER

Mayor Norm Childress called the special meeting to order at 6:00 p.m. in the Council Chambers
at City Hall.

Present were: Mayor Childress and Councilmembers Gaylord Brewer, Mike Everett, Dennis
McDonald, Gloria Mendoza and Joan Souders. Excused from the meeting were
Councilmembers Bill Moore and Javier Rodriguez.

Staff present were: City Administrator/Public Works Director Cus Arteaga, City Treasurer Matt
Cordray, Police Chief Kal Fuller, Library Director Elizabeth Jahnke, Wastewater Treatment Plant
Superintendent Dave Lorenz and City Clerk Anita Palacios.

2. 2017 PROPERTY TAXES — PROPOSED ORDINANCES LEVYING THE 2017 AD
VALOR PROPERTY TAXES AND EXCESS LEVY TAXES AND INCREASING THE
2017 PROPERTY TAX LEVY FOR THE CITY OF GRANDVIEW ABOVE THE “LIMIT
FACTOR”, UP TO 101 PERCENT

City Treasurer Cordray explained that pursuant to RCW 84.52.020, the City’s certification for the
purpose of levying 2017 property taxes was to be filed with the Board of Yakima County
Commissioners on or before November 30, 2016 or the City would receive no funding from this
source. To meet the objective and as a result of Referendum 47, the Council would need to
pass an ordinance for the levy amount up to the full 101% and pass a second ordinance
increasing the property tax levy to the Implicit Price Deflator (IPD). The County Commissioners
requested the ordinances be returned to the County on or before November 21, 2016.

Discussion took place.

On motion by Councilmember Everett, second by Councilmember Souders, Council
directed staff to move an ordinance levying the 2017 ad valor property taxes and excess
levy taxes and an ordinance increasing the 2017 property tax levy for the City of
Grandview above the “limit factor”, up to 101 percent to the November 8, 2016 regular
meeting for consideration.

3. 2017 PRELIMINARY BUDGET

2017 EXPENDITURE ESTIMATES — CURRENT EXPENSE FUND
City Treasurer Cordray continued the presentation of the 2017 preliminary budget, as follows:

Police Correction Services — Jail
2016 Budget $165,030
2017 Proposed $160,400
Notable Changes in 2017 —
s Increase Professional Services $10,000 (inmate medical bills, or external housing)
¢ Increase Repairs and Maintenance $3,000 {(HVAC compressor replacement)
s Increase Van Repair and Maintenance $1,000 {possible repairs on aging vehicle, if
needed)




Special Meeting Minutes — Budget
October 24, 2016
Page 2

o Purchase video conference system $5,000 (for prisoner visitations)

Police Communication Services
2016 Budget $549,900
2017 Proposed $578,500
Notable Changes in 2017 —
» Increase uniforms {new dispatch employees) $1,000
Increase in Professional Services (IT Support) $3,000
Increase in Communications {in-house email hosting) $4,000
Increase in Travel/Training {new employees) $1,000
Increase in Repairs/Maintenance (phone maintenance contract} $3,000
Computer replacements x 3 = $3,000 (Capital Replacement ltem)

Animal Control Services
2016 Budget $31,000
2017 Proposed $32,760
Notable Changes in 2017 — Continue contract for services with the Humane Society of Central
Washington for animal control {15 hours a week) coverage. Rate for the next year of 3-year
contract were:

e 2016 rate $29,484

e 2017 rate $30,960

YAKIMA COUNTY LAW & JUSTICE TAX FUND
Revenue

2016 Budget $402,975

2017 Proposed $413,925

Expenditures
2016 Budget $402,975

2017 Proposed $413,925
Notable Changes in 2017 — purchase the following equipment:
» Mobile car radios $13,000
Lower Valley repeater project $6,000
Crime scene investigations equipment (trailer supplies) $10,000
Search and Rescue equipment $6,000
Heavy vests (9 vests, 5 year expiration, $3,000 each) $30,000 — Capital Replacement
3 portable radios (3 reserves} $4,500 — Capital Replacement
3 pistols (3 reserves) $3,000 — Capital Replacement

STREET FUND

Revenue

2016 Budget $1,559,320
2017 Proposed $1,326,195

Expenditures

Roadway
2016 Budget $111,010

2017 Proposed $104,610



Special Meeting Minutes — Budget
October 24, 2016
Page 3

Notable Changes in 2017 —
¢ Speed display signs (West Wine Country Road) $8,000
» Beautification projects Wine Country Road $20,000

Drainage
2016 Budget $10,120

2017 Proposed $9,630
Notable Changes in 2017 — None

Structures

2016 Budget $1,570

2017 Proposed $2,450

Notable Changes in 2017 — None

Sidewalks

2016 Budget $9,940

2017 Proposed $8,450

Notable Changes in 2017 — sidewalk repairs and tree pruning $20,000

Street Lighting
2016 Budget $165,000

2017 Proposed $165,000
Notable Changes in 2017 — None

Traffic Control Devices

2016 Budget $65,770

2017 Proposed $73,820

Notable Changes in 2017 — None

Parking Facilities
2016 Budget $30

2017 Proposed $100
Notable Changes in 2017 — None

Snow & Ice Control

2016 Budget $20,550

2017 Proposed $27,850

Notable Changes in 2017 — None

Street Cleaning
2016 Budget $23,970

2017 Proposed $24,920
Notable Changes in 2017 — None

Roadside

2016 Budget $105,090

2017 Proposed $107,620
Notable Changes in 2017 — None



Special Meeting Minutes ~ Budget
October 24, 2016
Page 4

Maintenance Administration
2016 Budget $61,020

2017 Proposed $76,240

Notable Changes in 2017 — None

Street Construction

2016 Budget $423,000

2017 Proposed $7,000

Notable Changes in 2017 — None

Transportation Benegfit District
2016 Budget $145,910

2017 Proposed $112,670
Notable Changes in 2017 — street preservation $75,000

Following consensus of Council, another special meeting would be scheduled for Monday,
November 7, 2016 from 6:00 to 8:00 p.m., to continue discussion of the 2017 preliminary
budget.

4, ADJOURNMENT

The special meeting adjourned at 8:00 p.m.

Mayor Norm Childress Anita Palacios, City Clerk



GRANDVIEW CITY COUNCIL
COMMITTEE-OF-THE-WHOLE
MEETING MINUTES
OCTOBER 25, 2016

1. CALL TO ORDER

Mayor Norm Childress called the Committee-of-the-Whole meeting to order at 6:00 p.m. in the
Council Chambers at City Hall.

2. ROLL CALL

Present were: Mayor Childress and Councilmembers Gaylord Brewer, Mike Everett, Dennis
McDonald and Bill Moore. Excused from the meeting were Councilmembers Gloria Mendoza,
Javier Rodriguez and Joan Souders.

Staff present were: City Administrator/Public Works Director Cus Arteaga, City Attorney Quinn
Plant, City Treasurer Matt Cordray, Fire Chief Pat Mason, Fire Captain George Saenz, WWTP
Superintendent Dave Lorenz and City Clerk Anita Palacios.

Also present was City Engineer Justin Bellamy, PE, with HLA Engineering and Land Surveying,
Inc.

3. CITIZEN PARTICIPATION — None

4, NEW BUSINESS

A. Resolution accepting the bid for the Asahel Curtis Well Rehabilitation and
authorizing the Mayor to sign all contract documents with Carpenter
Drilling, LLC

At the May 24, 2016 meeting, Council approved Resolution No. 2016-27 approving Task Order
2016-06 with HLA Engineering Land Surveying, Inc., for the Asahel Curtis Well (S17)
Rehabilitation. This well source had been offline since 2009 due to significant loss in capacity,
continual pump failures, and water quality issues. This project would include evaluation of the
existing well condition and water quality, followed by cleaning and rehabilitation of the well, and
installation of a new well pump and motor to return this source to active service. These
upgrades would improve overall system reliability and provide additional well capacity to meet
system demands. The total estimated project cost, including engineering design and
construction services was estimated to be $155,000.00. This amount included $120,000.00 for
construction and $35,000.00 for engineering design and construction services. Council
allocated $155,000 for the rehabilitation of the Asahel Curiis (S17) Well and $50,000 for SCADA
well computer upgrades in the 2016 budget.

City Engineer Bellamy explained that bids for the Asahel Curtis Well Rehabilitation were opened
on October 18, 2016. A total of two (2) bids were received with Carpenter Drilling, LLC of
Benton City, Washington, submitting the low bid in the amount of $163,511.66. The low bid was
approximately seven (7) percent above the City Engineer’s estimate of $151,815.30.

Discussion took place.



Commiittee-of-the-Whole Meeting Minutes
October 25, 2016
Page 2

On motion by Councilmember Everett, second by Councilmember McDonald, the C.O.W.
moved Resolution No 2016-46 accepting the bid for the Asahel Curtis Well Rehabilitation
and authorizing the Mayor to sign all contract documents with Carpenter Drilling, LLC to
the October 25, 2016 regular Council meeting for consideration under the Consent
Agenda.

B. Resolution declaring certain City property from the Fire Department as
surplus and authorizing disposal by public auction, sale, trade or disposal

Fire Chief Mason explained that the Fire Department had 17 pagers and 3 portable radios that
due to changes in technology over the years were not compatible with the radio equipment
being used today and as such would not function. The Fire Department also had 3 extra 35’
extension ladders that came off of trucks that were declared surplus over the years that were no
longer utilized by the department.

Discussion took place.

On motion by Councilmember Moore, second by Councilmember Brewer, the C.O.W.
moved a resolution declaring certain City property from the Fire Department as surplus
and authorizing disposal by public auction, sale, trade or disposal to the November 8"
regular Council meeting agenda for consideration under the Consent Agenda.

C. GMC Chapter 15.24 Fire Prevention — Adopting 2015 internationat Fire Code

Fire Chief Mason explained that in 2013, Council adopted the 2012 Edition of the International
Fire Code. In the latter part of 2015 and early 2016, the 2015 Edition of the International Fire
Code was reviewed by the State Building Code Council. The State Building Code Council then
sent it to the State Legislature with their recommended amendments. The State Legislature
adopted it in 2016 which then makes it eligible for adoption on the local level as of July 1, 2016,
An updated Edition of the International Fire Code as published by the International Code
Council was typically produced every three years. The passage of an ordinance to adopt the
2015 Edition of the International Fire Code would keep the City current on the standard of code
enforcement that was occurring throughout the State. In an effort to provide a safe and stable
environment for businesses to operate, one of the best tools was the Fire Code. The Fire Code
would allow the City to make every effort to avoid any potential loss due to fire or injury for the
business owner, the consumer and members of the emergency services.

Discussion took place.

On motion by Councilmember Everett, second by Councilmember Brewer, the C.O.W.
moved an ordinance amending Grandview Municipal Code Chapter 15.24 Fire Prevention
for the adoption of the 2015 Edition of the International Fire Code to the November 8
regular Council meeting agenda for consideration.

D. Growth Management Update: Development Requlations, Critical Area
Ordinance, Comprehensive Plan Updates

At the October 11, 2016 C.O.W. meeting, the City's Growth Management Update to include
development regulations, Critical Areas Ordinance, and Comprehensive Plan updates were
presented. The review and discussion was continued to the October 25, 2016 C.O.W. meeting.



Committee-of-the-Whole Meeting Minutes
October 25, 2016
Page 3

City Clerk Palacios advised that following review the next step would be to schedule a public
hearing before the Council to receive comments on the Growth Management Update.

Discussion took place.

On motion by Councilmember Moore, second by Councilmember McDonald, the C.O.W.
directed staff to schedule the public hearing for the Growth Management Update.

E. Specifications for sealed bids for official newspaper

At the August 23, 2016 C.0O.W. meeting, the Council requested that the specifications for sealed
bids for official newspaper be reviewed by the C.O.W. prior to advertisement in November.

Discussion took place.
Councilmember Brewer requested that “characters per column inch” be added to the bid form.

On motion by Councilmember Brewer, second by Councilmember McDonald, the C.O.W.
directed staff to proceed with the call for bids for official newspaper.

5. OTHER BUSINESS

USDA Funding Opportunity for Fire Equipment — Mayor Childress advised that at the IACC
Conference last week, he and City Administrator Arteaga met with the Yakima Area
representative of the United States Department of Agricuiture (USDA) Rural Development to
discuss funding opportunities for the purchase of a fire truck and equipment. He explained that
USDA provides affordable funding to public safety services such as fire departments to
purchase fire trucks and equipment. Funding was available in low interest direct loans. The
loan repayment terms may not be longer than the useful life of the equipment or a maximum of
40 years, whichever was less. Interest rates were currently 2.375%. Once the loan was
approved, the interest rate was fixed for the entire term of the loan. Beginning in 2016, Council
agreed to annually set aside funds for the future purchase of self-contained breathing
apparatuses (SCBA) in the amount of $33,000 and the future purchase of a fire engine in the
amount of $20,000. It was estimated that a USDA loan in the amount of $500,000 to purchase
a fire engine, equipment and SCBA over a 30 year term would cost the City an estimated
annual repayment of $25,000.

Following discussion, the C.O.W. directed staff to compile information regarding the USDA
funding opportunity for further consideration.

6. ADJOURNMENT

The study session adjourned at 6:50 p.m.

Mayor Norm Childress Anita Palacios, City Clerk



GRANDVIEW CITY COUNCIL
REGULAR MEETING MINUTES
OCTOBER 25, 2016

1. CALL TO ORDER

Mayor Norm Childress called the regular meeting to order at 7:00 p.m. in the Council Chambers
at City Hall.

Present were: Mayor Childress and Councilmembers Gaylord Brewer, Mike Everett, Dennis
McDonald and Bill Moore. Excused from the meeting were Councilmembers Gloria Mendoza,
Javier Rodriguez and Joan Souders.

Staff present were: City Administrator/Public Works Director Cus Arteaga, City Attorney Quinn
Plant, City Treasurer Matt Cordray, WWTP Superintendent Dave Lorenz and City Clerk Anita
Palacios.

2.  PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

City Treasurer Cordray led the pledge of allegiance.

3. PRESENTATIONS

A. Pacific Power Foundation Grants — Toby Freeman, Regional Business
Manager

Toby Freeman, Regional Business Manager with Pacific Power, introduced himself to the
Council and explained the Pacific Power Foundation grant program.

4. PUBLIC COMMENT

David Layden, 511 Broadway, Grandview, WA, requested to review the payroll and claim check
register.

Staff provided Mr. Layden with the payroll and claim check register for his review.
5. CONSENT AGENDA

Councilmember Brewer requested that the minutes of the October 17, 2016 Special Council
meeting — Budget be amended to indicate that Councilmember Javier Rodriguez was absent.

On motion by Councilmember Moore, second by Councilmember McDonald, Council
approved the Consent Agenda consisting of the following:

A. Minutes of the October 10, 2016 Special Council meeting — Budget

B. Minutes of the October 11, 2016 Committee-of-the-Whole meeting

C. Minutes of the October 11, 2016 Council meeting

D. Minutes of the October 17, 2016 Special Council meeting — Budget as
amended

E. Payroll Electronic Fund Transfers (EFT) Nos. 5645-5649 in the amount of
$72,628.57

F.

Payroll Check Nos. 9182-9199 in the amount of $81,113.73



Regular Meeting Minutes
October 25, 2016
Page 2

Payroll Direct Deposit 10/01/16-10/15/16 in the amount of $89,989.22
Claim Check Nos. 111521-111608 in the amount of $249,967.20
Resolution No. 2016-46 accepting the bid for the Asahel Curtis Well
Rehabilitation and authorizing the Mayor to sign all contract documents
with Carpenter Drilling, LLC

I

6. ACTIVE AGENDA

A. Public Hearing — 2017 Current Expense Fund Revenue Sources

This item was previously discussed at the October 17, 2016 and October 24, 2016 special
budget meetings.

Mayor Childress opened the public hearing for the purpose of receiving comments on the 2017
Current Expense Fund Revenue Sources.

City Treasurer Cordray reported that the operating revenue for the Current Expense Fund in
2017 was estimated to be $5,165,910. He provided a detail of the Current Expense Fund
revenue estimates as follows:

Revenue Type Amount
Property Taxes $1,455,000
Sales Tax $ 604,500
Criminal Justice Tax $ 155,000
City Utility Taxes $ 987,500
Private Utility Taxes $1,005,000
Other Taxes $ 1,200
Licenses & Permits $ 126,250
Intergovernmental Revenues $ 333,000
Charges for Service $ 155,450
Fines & Forfeits $ 190,100
Misc. & Other Revenues $ 152,910
Total Revenue $5,165,910

Mayor Childress requested public comments. The following public comment was received.

David Layton, 511 Broadway, Grandview, thanked the Council for their efforts in preparing the
preliminary budget. He attended the meetings and they were very informative and he
appreciated that.

City Clerk Palacios indicated that there were nc public comments received by mail.

The public testimony portion of the hearing was declared closed and no further comments were
received.

B. Regolution No. 2016-43 fixing the time and date for a public hearing to

vacate that Portion of West Main Street adjacent to property owned by
Yakima Valley College as petitioned by Yakima Valley College

This item was previously discussed at the October 11, 2016 C.O.W. meeting.



Regular Meeting Minutes
October 25, 2016
Page 3

On motion by Councilmember Moore, second by Councilmember Everett, Council
approved Resolution No. 2016-43 fixing the time and date for a public hearing to vacate
that Portion of West Main Street adjacent to property owned by Yakima Valley College as
petitioned by Yakima Valley College.

C. Resolution No. 2016-44 waiving the requirements of the State bid law to
aliow the purchase of pool slide from a sole source distributor

This item was previously discussed at the October 11, 2016 C.O.W. meeting.

On motion by Councilmember Everett, second by Councilmember Brewer, Council
approved Resolution No. 2016-44 waiving the requirements of the State bid law to allow
the purchase of pool slide from a sole source distributor.

D. Resolution No. 2016-45 authorizing the Mayor to sign a Professional
Services Contract for Hearing Examiner Services with Gary M. Cuillier

This item was previously discussed at the October 11, 2016 C.O.W. meeting.

On motion by Councilmember Moore, second by Councilmember McDonald, Council
approved Resolution No. 2016-45 authorizing the Mayor to sign a Professional Services
Contract for Hearing Examiner Services with Gary M. Cuillier.

E. Ordinance No. 2016-21 amending Grandview Municipal Code Section
13.28.060(B) setting irrigation water rates

At the October 17, 2016 special Council meeting regarding the budget, City Administrator/Public
Works Director Arteaga explained that staff was proposing a 1% irrigation rate increase for 2017
to account for a rate increase from Sunnyside Valley Irrigation District. The 1% irrigation rate
increase would increase the 2016 irrigation rate from $11.17 to $11.28 in 2017, a difference of
11 cents.

On motion by Councilmember Everett, second by Councilmember Brewer, Council
approved Ordinance No. 2016-21 amending Grandview Municipal Code Section
13.28.060(B) setting irrigation water rates.

F. Ordinance No. 2016-22 amending Grandview Municipal Code Section
13.28.085 setting garbage rates

At the October 17, 2016 special Council meeting regarding the budget, City Administrator/Public
Works Director Arteaga explained that staff was proposing a 1% garbage rate increase for 2017
to account for tipping fee increase from Yakima County Solid Waste Department. The 1%
garbage rate increase would increase the 2016 garbage rate from $13.65 to $13.80 in 2017, a
difference of 15 cents.

On motion by Councilmember Everett, second by Councilmember Moore, Council
approved Ordinance No. 2016-22 amending Grandview Municipal Code Section 13.28.085
setting garbage rates.



Regular Meeting Minutes
October 25, 2016
Page 4

7. UNFINISHED AND NEW BUSINESS — None
8. CITY ADMINISTRATOR AND/OR STAFF REPORTS — None

9. MAYOR & COUNCILMEMBER MEETING REPORT

2017 Preliminary Budget — Council thanked the staff for their efforts in preparation and
presentation of the 2017 preliminary budget.

10. ADJOURNMENT

On motion by Councilmember Moore, second by Councilmember McDonald, Council
adjourned the meeting at 7:35 p.m.

Mayor Norm Childress Anita Palacios, City Clerk



RESOLUTION NO. 2016-47

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF GRANDVIEW, WASHINGTON,
DECLARING CERTAIN CITY PROPERTY FROM THE FIRE DEPARTMENT
AS SURPLUS AND AUTHORIZING DISPOSAL BY PUBLIC AUCTION,
SALE OR TRADE

WHEREAS, the Fire Department has 17 pagers, 3 portable radios and 3 35'
extension ladders that have outlived their useful life and are no longer needed for the
conduct of City business; and,

WHEREAS, the City Council has determined that it is in the best interest of the
City that the foregoing described equipment be declared surplus and disposed of;

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY
OF GRANDVIEW, as follows:

Section 1. The 17 pagers, 3 portable radios and 3 35’ extension ladders as
described on Exhibit “A” attached hereto and incorporated herein by reference are
hereby declared to be surplus.

Section 2.  City staff is authorized to dispose of the equipment described in
section 1 of this resolution by public auction, sale or trade-in for an amount that
represents a fair market value of the equipment.

Section3. The City Administrator is authorized to establish a minimum
sale/trade-in price that reflects a fair market value of the equipment described in section
1 of this resolution as deemed necessary to protect the City's interests.

PASSED by the CITY COUNCIL and APPROVED by the MAYOR at its regular
meeting on November 8, 2016.

MAYOR
ATTEST:
CITY CLERK
APPROVED AS TO FORM:
CITY ATTORNEY



FIRE DEPARTMENT SURPLUS EQUIPMENT

EXHIBIT “A”

SEPTEMBER 9, 2016
LADDERS QUANTITY
35 FOOT / 3 SECTION / EXTENSION LADDER 3

RADJO EQUIPMENT

CHARGER BASES PAGERS MOBILE RADIOS
354 646BTC25B9 428AQ0Q1849
1008 646BQQ25GR 428AUC0613
237 646BTC2588B 624AZ2G0013
389 646BRL22DJ
998 646XXX23W2
102B 646BMA2565
397 646XUC2578
187 646BMA2562
391 646XUC2579
978 646BTC25B6
98B 646BMA2570
482C 646XWS23RV
349 646XUC252D
98348 646BMA2564
483C 646BMD3987
1018 646BTC25BC

395 6468MA2563
481C

244

393




ORDINANCE NO. 2016-23

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF GRANDVIEW, WASHINGTON,
AMENDING GRANDVIEW MUNICIPAL CODE CHAPTER 15.24 FIRE PREVENTION
TO ADOPT THE 2015 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE

WHEREAS, the City of Grandview has previously adopted the Intemational Fire
Code, 2012 edition published by the International Code Council, and,

WHEREAS, a new 2015 version of said Fire Code has been published by the
International Code Council which the City would like to adopt with certain amendments,

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Grandview finds and determines that
amending Chapter 15.34 of the Grandview Municipal Code to adopt the 2015 Edition of
the International Fire Code is in the best interest of the residents of the City of
Grandview and will promote the health, safety and welfare,

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF GRANDVIEW,
WASHINGTON DO ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 1. Grandview Municipal Code Chapter 15.24 Fire Prevention, which reads
as follows:
Chapter 15.24
FIRE PREVENTION

Sections:

15.24.010 International Fire Code — Adopted.

15.24.020 Future amendments and additions.

15.24.030 Amended definitions.

15.24.040 Amendments to the 2012 International Fire Code.
15.24.050 Fees.

15.24.010 International Fire Code — Adopted.

The International Fire Code, 2012 Edition, published by the international Code Council,
and all standards referenced therein as amended by Washington State amendments
and as amended in GMC 15.24.040 and Sections 503.1, 503.1.1, 503.1.2, 503.1.3, all
of 503.2, 503.3 and 503.4 of the 2012 International Fire Code, pertaining to street, road
and access standards, are hereby adopted as the fire code in the City of Grandview.

15.24.020 Future amendments and additions.

All future amendments and additions to the 2012 Edition of the Intemational Fire Code,
when printed and one copy thereof has been filed with the appropriate department, shall
be considered and accepted as amendments and additions to the fire code adopted in
GMC 15.24.010.

ORDINANCE — FIRE PREVENTION PAGE 1 l’



15.24.030 Amended definitions.

Notwithstanding the definitions contained in the 2012 Intenational Fire Code adopted
by reference in this chapter and except as otherwise provided in this chapter, all
references in the provisions of such code to “jurisdiction” shall be construed as the “City
of Grandview”; references to the “administrator” shall be construed as the “Grandview
Fire Chief”; references to the “Fire Department” shall mean the “Grandview Fire
Department”; references to the “chief” or “fire code official” shall be construed as the
“Grandview Fire Chief” or his “designees”; references to the “fire protection bureau”
shall be construed as the “Grandview Fire Department.”

15.24.040 Amendments to the 2012 International Fire Code.

The following amendments to the 2012 International Fire Code adopted in GMC
15.24.010 are hereby enacted and adopted and shall replace the sections of the fire
code in the City of Grandview.

A The Grandview Fire Chief or his designee is hereby appointed and
designated as the official responsible for the administration and enforcement of this
chapter.

B. Pursuant to Section 101.2.1 of the International Fire Code, 2012 Edition,
the following appendices to the 2012 International Fire Code are hereby adopted:

1. Appendix B — Fire-Flow Requirements for Buildings;

2. Appendix C - Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution;

3. Appendix D - Fire Apparatus Access Roads;

4. Appendix E — Hazard Categories;

5. Appendix F — Hazard Ranking;

6. Appendix G ~ Cryogenic Fluids — Weight and Volume Equivalents;

7. Appendix H — Hazardous Materials Management Plan (HMMP) and
Hazardous Materials Inventory Statement (HMIS) Instructions;

8. Appendix | — Fire Protection Systems — Noncompliant Conditions.

C. Section 108 of the International Fire Code, 2012 Edition, Board of Appeals, is
not adopted. Appeals under this fire code shall be pursuant to Chapter 2.50 GMC.

D. Subsection 109.3 of Section 109, Violations, of the International Fire Code,
2012 Edition, adopted herein is hereby amended to read as follows:

109.3 — Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to comply with any
of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do work in violation
of the approved construction documents or directive of the Fire Code Official, or of a
permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, except as provided in
section 111.4, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor punishable by a fine of up to $1,000.00
and/or up to 90 days in jail. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has
been served shall be deemed a separate offense.

ORDINANCE - FIRE PREVENTION PAGE 2 4



E. Subsection 111.4 of Section 111, Stop Work Order, of the International
Fire Code, 2012 Edition, adopted herein is hereby amended to read as follows:

111.4 — Failure to Comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been
served with a “stop work order”, except such work as that person is directed to perform
to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be liable for a fine of not less than
$250.00 nor more than $1,000.00. Each day that said violation of the stop work order
continues after said notice has been issued shall be deemed a separate offense.

F. Section 5504.3 of Section 5504, Flammable Cryogenic Fluids, of the
International Fire Code, 2012 Edition, adopted herein is hereby amended to read as
follows:

5504.3 - Limitations. The storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers
outside of buildings is prohibited in the City of Grandview except in areas zoned M2,

G. Subsection 5704.2.9.6.1 of Section 5704, Storage, of the International Fire
Code, 2012 Edition, adopted herein is amended to read as follows:

5704.2.9.6.1 — Location where above ground tanks are prohibited. The storage of Class
| and 1l liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited in the City of
Grandview except in areas zoned M1 and M2.

H. Subsection 5606.2.4.4 of Section 5606, Special Operations, of the
International Fire Code, 2012 Edition, adopted herein is hereby amended to read as
follows:

5606.2.4.4 — Location where above ground tanks are prohibited. The storage of Class |
and Il liquids in above-ground tanks is prohibited in the City of Grandview except in
areas zoned M1 and M2,

I Section 6104.2 of Section 6104, Location of LP Gas Containers, of the
International Fire Code, 2012 Edition, adopted herein is hereby amended to read as
follows:

6104.2 — Maximum capacity within established limits. Except in C2, M1 and M2 zoned
areas, the storage of liquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily populated
areas or congested areas, may not exceed, in the aggregate at one installation a water
capacity of 2,000 gallons (7570 L).

15.24.050 Fees.

A. Fire and Life Safety Plan Fees.

Sq. Footage of Structure Fee
Under 1,000 $30.00
ORDINANCE - FIRE PREVENTION PAGE 3



Sq. Footage of Structure Fee

1,001 - 2,500 $45.00
2,501 - 5,000 $60.00
5,001 - 7,500 $75.00
7,501 - 10,000 $90.00
10,001 - 12,500 $105.00
12,501 - 15,000 $120.00
15,001 - 17,500 $135.00
17,501 — 20,000 $150.00
Over 20,000 $165.00

B. Fuel Tank Permit Fees.
1. Flammable or Combustible Liquid Storage Tanks.

Size of Tank Fee

1 — 300 gallons $50.00
301 - 600 $75.00
601 - 1,000 $100.00
1,001 - 5,000 $125.00
5,001 - 10,000 $150.00
Over 10,000 $200.00
All removal permits $50.00

2. Liquid/Liquefied Petroleum Gas Storage Tanks.

Size of Tank Fee

30 - 1,000 gallons $50.00
Over 1,000 $100.00

No charge for removal

Any other fire and life safety permits will be charged at a rate of $50.00 each, unless
otherwise rated in the current adopted fire code.

is hereby amended to read as follows:

Chapter 15.24
FIRE PREVENTION

Sections:
15.24.010 International Fire Code — Adopted.
15.24.020 Future amendments and additions.

ORDINANCE - FIRE PREVENTION PAGE 4



15.24.030 Amended definitions.
15.24.040 Amendments to the 2015 Intemational Fire Code.
15.24.050 Fees.

15.24.010 Intemational Fire Code — Adopted.

The International Fire Code, 2015 Edition, published by the International Code Council,
and all standards referenced therein as amended by Washington State amendments
and as amended in GMC 15.24.040 and Sections 503.1, 503.1.1, 503.1.2, 503.1.3, all
of 503.2, 503.3 and 503.4 of the 2015 International Fire Code, pertaining to street, road
and access standards, are hereby adopted as the fire code in the City of Grandview.

15.24.020 Future amendments and additions.

All future amendments and additions to the 2015 Edition of the Intemational Fire Code,
when printed and one copy thereof has been filed with the appropriate department, shall
be considered and accepted as amendments and additions to the fire code adopted in
GMC 15.24.010.

15.24.030 Amended definitions.

Notwithstanding the definitions contained in the 2015 International Fire Code adopted
by reference in this chapter and except as otherwise provided in this chapter, all
references in the provisions of such code to “jurisdiction” shall be construed as the “City
of Grandview”; references to the “administrator” shall be construed as the “Grandview
Fire Chief”; references to the “Fire Department” shall mean the “Grandview Fire
Department”; references to the “chief” or “fire code official” shall be construed as the
“Grandview Fire Chief” or his “designees”; references to the “fire protection bureau”
shall be construed as the “Grandview Fire Department.”

15.24.040 Amendments to the 2015 International Fire Code.

The following amendments to the 201% Intemational Fire Code adopted in GMC
15.24.010 are hereby enacted and adopted and shall replace the sections of the fire
code in the City of Grandview.

A The Grandview Fire Chief or his designee is hereby appointed and
designated as the official responsible for the administration and enforcement of this
chapter.

B. Pursuant to Section 101.2.1 of the International Fire Code, 2015 Edition,
the following appendices to the 2015 International Fire Code are hereby adopted:
Appendix B — Fire-Flow Requirements for Buildings;

Appendix C — Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution;

Appendix D — Fire Apparatus Access Roads;

Appendix E — Hazard Categories;

Appendix F — Hazard Ranking;

Appendix G — Cryogenic Fluids — Weight and Volume Equivalents;
Appendix H — Hazardous Materials Management Plan (HMMP) and
Hazardous Materials Inventory Statement (HMIS) Instructions;

NGO AW

ORDINANCE - FIRE PREVENTION PAGE 5



8. Appendix | — Fire Protection Systems — Noncompliant Conditions.

C. Section 108 of the International Fire Code, 2015 Edition, Board of Appeals, is
not adopted. Appeals under this fire code shall be pursuant to Chapter 2.50 GMC.

D. Subsection 109.3 of Section 109, Violations, of the International Fire Code,
2015 Edition, adopted herein is hereby amended to read as follows:

Violations of this chapter shall be enforced and penalties imposed in accordance
with Chapter 15.72 GMC.

E. Subsection 111.4 of Section 111, Stop Work Order, of the International
Fire Code, 2015 Edition, adopted herein is hereby amended to read as follows:

111.4 ~ Failure to Comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been
served with a “stop work order”, except such work as that person is directed to perform
to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be liable for a fine of not less than
$250.00 nor more than $1,000.00. Each day that said violation of the stop work order
continues after said notice has been issued shall be deemed a separate offense.

F. Section 5504.3 of Section 5504, Flammable Cryogenic Fluids, of the
International Fire Code, 2015 Edition, adopted herein is hereby amended to read as
follows:

5504.3 — Limitations. The storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers
outside of buildings is prohibited in the City of Grandview except in areas zoned M2.

G. Subsection 5704.2.9.6.1 of Section 5704, Storage, of the International Fire
Code, 2015 Edition, adopted herein is amended to read as follows:

5704.2.9.6.1 - Location where above ground tanks are prohibited. The storage of Class
I and Il liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited in the City of
Grandview except in areas zoned M1 and M2.

H. Section 6104.2 of Section 6104, Location of LP Gas Containers, of the
International Fire Code, 2015 Edition, adopted herein is hereby amended to read as
follows:

6104.2 — Maximum capacity within established limits. Except in C2, M1 and M2 zoned
areas, the storage of liquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily populated
areas or congested areas, may not exceed, in the aggregate at one installation a water
capacity of 2,000 gallons (7570 L).

ORDINANCE - FIRE PREVENTION PAGE 6



15.24.050 Fees.

A. Fire and Life Safety Plan Fees.

Sq. Footage of Structure Fee
Under 1,000 $30.00
1,001 - 2,500 $45.00
2,501 - 5,000 $60.00
5,001 - 7,500 $75.00
7,501 — 10,000 $90.00
10,001 - 12,500 $105.00
12,501 - 15,000 $120.00
15,001 - 17,500 $135.00
17,601 — 20,000 $150.00
Over 20,000 $165.00

B. Fuel Tank Permit Fees.
1. Flammable or Combustible Liquid Storage Tanks.

Size of Tank Fee

1 — 300 gallons $50.00
301 - 600 $75.00
601 - 1,000 $100.00
1,001 — 5,000 $125.00
5,001 - 10,000 $150.00
Over 10,000 $200.00
All removal permits $50.00

2. Liquid/Liquefied Petroleum Gas Storage Tanks.

Size of Tank Fee

30 - 1,000 gallons $50.00
Over 1,000 $100.00

No charge for removal

Any other fire and life safety permits will be charged at a rate of $50.00 each, unless
otherwise rated in the current adopted fire code.

SECTION 2. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect five (5) days after its
passage and publication as required by law.

ORDINANCE - FIRE PREVENTION PAGE 7



PASSED by the CITY COUNCIL and approved by the MAYOR at its regular

meeting on November 8, 2016.

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

CITY ATTORNEY

PUBLICATION: 11/9/16
EFFECTIVE: 1114/16

ORDINANCE - FIRE PREVENTION

MAYOR

ATTEST:

CITY CLERK

PAGE 8 }b



BOARD OF YAKIMA COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Michael D. Leita Kevin J. Bouchey J. Rand Elliott
District 1 District 2 District 3

ECEIVE

SEP -6 2018
Anita Palacios

City of Grandview CITY OF GRANDVIEW

207 W 2nd Street
Grandview WA 98930

September 2, 2016

Pursuant to legislation RCW 84.52.020, your Certification for the purpose of levying 2017 property taxes is fo be filed with
the Board of Yakima County Commissioners on or before November 30, 2016 or you will receive no funding from this source.

To meet this objective you need to complete the following:
1. As aresull of Referendum 47, in a public hearing or forum you will need to pass the following:

¢ ALL TAXING DISTRICT-
Will need t¢ pass one resolution for the levy amount up to the full 101% (see sample #1).

o TAXING DISTRICTS WITH OVER 10,000 POPULATION -
Will need to pass a second resolution increasing the property tax levy to the Implicit Price Deflator (IPD) (see sample

#2).

2. Complete a Tax Levy Certification form (see sample #3). On November 29, 2016 the Board of Yakima County Commissioners
will, by resolution cerlify the requested tax amounts to be levied upon property for each taxing district, per RCW 84.52.070.

3. Include an estimate of your cash balance at the beginning and ending of your budget period, per RCW 84.52.025.

Please return cach of the above items to me in the County Commissioners Office and a copy of the resolution(s) or
ordinance(s) to the Yakima County Department of Assessment en or before November 21, 2016.

1f you have any questions you may contact me at 574-1316 or by e-mail at forrest.smith@co.yakima. wa.us.
Thank you for your cooperation.

Sincerely,

Forrest A. Smith
Assistant Budget Director, Yakima County Commissioners

Cc: Jucob Tate, Department of Property Assessment

128 North Second Street | Room #232 | Yakima, WA 98901 | 509-574-1500 | www.yakimacounty,us/cmrs )ﬂ



District Name Grandview City

Current Tax Base* $458,258,220

“This includes estimated state assessed and personal property amounts. Your actual abliity to levy may
be higher.

Current Levy Max Amount Calculations
2016 Max Lawful $1,483,059.80

Times 1.01 (if you certify a resolution adopting an increase) $1,497,890.40

Additional Request Monies For NC ($3,863,331) $12,888.56
Additional Funds for Annexations $993.64
Final Before State Rate Limit: $1,511,772.61

Maximum State Limit $1,546,621.49

Maximum Current Request Allowed $1,511,772.61

Your Resolutions or Ordinances must reference a % Increase over last years levy, and a $
amount increase over last years levy. You must also certify a total budget request amount. The
% Increase over last year *does not* include added funds for New consiruction, State Assessed
or Annexations. The budget request must include those as it certifies the total amount you
request. You are still limited to the above Maximum Current Request Allowed,

Starting Point for Calculations of $ and % Increase $1,522,022.65
1% of Previous Amount {$ increase) $15,081.40
1% of Previous Amount {total) $1,537,104.05

Bacausa the actual % Is less than the 1%, you should usa the above two numbers in your resclutions or
ordinances and not the bottom two.

Actual § increase of Previous Amount at Maximum: {$10,250.04)

Actual % increase of Previous Amount at Maximum -0.6796%

If you have any questions please call Jacob Tate at (509) 574-1112.



ORDINANCE NO. 2016-24

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF GRANDVIEW, WASHINGTON,
LEVYING THE 2017 AD VALOR PROPERTY TAXES AND EXCESS LEVY TAXES

WHEREAS, the City Council has met and considered its budget for the calendar
year 2017; and

WHEREAS, the City Council, in the course of considering the budget for 2017,
has reviewed all sources of revenue and examined all anticipated expenses and
obligations; and

WHEREAS, the City Council has determined that it is in the best interest of and
necessary to meet the expenses and obligations of the City of Grandview and a
substantial need exists for the property tax revenue to be increased in 2017,

NOW THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF GRANDVIEW,
WASHINGTON DO ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. The regular levy request in the amount of $1,511,770.00, which is a
$32,770.00 increase from 2016 levy amount and a 2.2% increase of that same 2016
levy amount, plus any amount allowed for new construction and increase in state
assessed values.

Section 2. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect five (5) days after its
passage and publication as required by law.

PASSED by the CITY COUNCIL and APPROVED by the MAYOR at its regular
meeting on November 8, 2016.

MAYOR
ATTEST:
CITY CLERK
APPROVED AS TO FORM:
CITY ATTORNEY

PUBLISHED: 11/9/16
EFFECTIVE: 11/14/16



ORDINANCE NO. 2016-25

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF GRANDVIEW, WASHINGTON,
INCREASING THE 2017 PROPERTY TAX LEVY FOR THE CITY OF GRANDIEW
ABOVE THE “LIMIT FACTOR” UP TO 101 PERCENT

WHEREAS, the Grandview City Council has met and considered its budget for
the calendar year 2017; and

WHEREAS, the City Council, in the course of considering the budget for 2017,
has reviewed all sources of revenue and examined all anticipated expenses and
obligations; and

WHEREAS, the City Council has determined that it is in the best interest of and
necessary to meet the expenses and obligations of the City of Grandview and a
substantial need exists to increase the regular property tax levy rate above the rate of
inflation;

NOW THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF GRANDVIEW,
WASHINGTON DO ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. The limit factor for the regular levy for the calendar year of 2017 shall
be 101% of the highest amount of regular property taxes that could have been lawfully
levied in the City of Grandview in any year.

Section 2. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect five (5) days after its
passage and publication as required by law.

PASSED by the CITY COUNCIL and APPROVED by the MAYOR at its regular
meeting on November 8, 2016.

MAYOR
ATTEST:
CITY CLERK
APPROVED AS TO FORM:
CITY ATTORNEY

PUBLISHED: 11/9/16
EFFECTIVE: 11/14/16



Tax Levy Request Certification

STATE OF WASHINGTON )
COUNTY OF YAKIMA )

I, Anita Palacios, City Clerk of the City of Grandview, do hereby certify that the

City Council of said City and appearing in the minutes of a meeting held on the
8th day of November, 2016, requesting the Board of Commissioners of Yakima
County to levy taxes as follows:

Regular levy request in the amount of $1,511,770.00, which is a
$32,770.00 increase from the 2016 levy amount and a 2.2% increase of
that same 2016 levy amount, plus any amount allowed for new
construction and increase in state assessed values.

At this time, | also certify that the population of said City is approximately 11,010.

CITY OF GRANDVIEW

Anita G. Palacios, MMC
City Clerk

Dated: November 8, 2016



